
From: Office Office office@goochfirm.com
Subject: RE: Retainer

Date: November 22, 2017 at 8:48 AM
To: Paul Dulberg pdulberg@comcast.net

I’m	guessing	it	was	never	dated.	The	one	Baudin’s	office	sent	to	us	is	fine.
	
Did	Tom	tell	you	he	needs	the	costs	for	the	filing	fee	paid	before	we	can	actually	file	the
complaint?		I	can	find	out	how	much	they	are	and	let	you	know	(unless	you	already	leB	it	last
night,	I	was	gone	before	your	appointment	ended).

Thanks
	
Margaret G. Buckley
Paralegal
The Gooch Firm
209 South Main Street
Wauconda, Illinois 60084
(847) 526-0110 (phone)
(847) 526-0603 (fax)

This communication is covered by the Electronic Communications Privacy Act, found at 18
U.S.C. 2510 et. seq. and is intended to remain confidential and is subject to applicable
attorney/client and/or work product privileges. If you are not the intended recipient of this
message, or if this message has been addressed to you in error, please immediately alert the
sender by reply e-mail and then delete this message and all attachments. Do not deliver,
distribute or copy this message and/or any attachments and if you are not the intended
recipient, do not disclose the contents or take any action in reliance upon the information
contained in this communication or any attachments.
	
	
	
From:	Paul	Dulberg	[mailto:pdulberg@comcast.net]	
Sent:	Wednesday,	November	22,	2017	6:21	AM
To:	Office	Office	<office@goochfirm.com>
Subject:	Re:	Retainer
	

Hi Margret,
I'm sorry to say but if I had a dated copy it would have been in the boxes of
documents you scanned.
If you cant find it in the scanned documents please let me know, I can go through
the boxes again over this thanksgiving weekend.
Let me know either way.
Thanks,
Paul



PS. Honestly, My memory is a bit foggy due to the time that's elapsed since I first
met with Hans Mast and signed that agreement but the way I remember it Hans had
me sign the agreement and it didn't have a date on it. I remember asking about that
cause I thought I had to fill it in and I wasn't very good at writing anymore due to the
accident and Hans said something about it doesn't matter because his secretary
Sheila would take care of that. I just said ok and signed my name as best as I could
at the time. I trusted it would have been done.

On	November	21,	2017	at	1:02	PM	Office	Office	<office@goochfirm.com>	wrote:

Hi	Paul,

I	emailed	Myrna	at	Randy’s	office	when	I	didn’t	hear	back	from	you	and	she
provided	a	signed	copy	of	the	retainer	with	Popovich,	however,	it	is	not	dated.	If	you
have	any	addiXonal	copies	of	this,	please	print	them	and	bring	them	with	you	today
at	4	pm.

Thanks,

	

Margaret G. Buckley
Paralegal

The Gooch Firm
209 South Main Street
Wauconda, Illinois 60084
(847) 526-0110 (phone)
(847) 526-0603 (fax)

This communication is covered by the Electronic Communications Privacy Act,
found at 18 U.S.C. 2510 et. seq. and is intended to remain confidential and is
subject to applicable attorney/client and/or work product privileges. If you are
not the intended recipient of this message, or if this message has been addressed
to you in error, please immediately alert the sender by reply e-mail and then
delete this message and all attachments. Do not deliver, distribute or copy this
message and/or any attachments and if you are not the intended recipient, do
not disclose the contents or take any action in reliance upon the information
contained in this communication or any attachments.

mailto:office@goochfirm.com

