From:
Subject:
Date:
To:

PAUL DULBERG paul_dulberg@comcast.net

Re: Retainer

November 12, 2018 at 8:50 AM

Mary Winch marywinch@clintonlaw.net, Ed Clinton ed@clintonlaw.net, Julia Wllliams juliawilliams@clintonlaw.net

Good Morning,

Will you be in court tomorrow or do | need to ask Judge Meyer for more time?
Thanks,

Paul

On November 8, 2018 at 8:21 AM Mary Winch <marywinch@clintonlaw.net> wrote:

This is Mary from the Clinton Law Firm replying. We do have it. We received both the retainer
agreement and check late Tuesday afternoon.

Mary Winch
Legal Assistant

Mary Winch

Legal Assistant

The Clinton Law Firm LLC
111 W Washington Street
Suite 1437

Chicago, IL 60602

Phone: 312.357.1515
Fax: 312.201.0737

From: PAUL DULBERG <paul_dulberg@comcast.net>

Reply-To: PAUL DULBERG <paul_dulberg@comcast.net>

Date: Thursday, November 8, 2018 at 6:52 AM

To: "ed@clintonlaw.net" <ed@clintonlaw.net>, "juliawilliams@clintonlaw.net"
<juliawilliams@clintonlaw.net>, "marywinch@clintonlaw.net"
<marywinch@clintonlaw.net>

Subject: Retainer

Good Morning Julia,

Did you receive the signed retainer agreement with the check?
It was sent out last Saturday.

Thanks,

Paul



