From:
Subject:
Date:
To:

Bcc:

Paul Dulberg pdulberg@icloud.com &

Fwd: REQUEST FOR TRANSCRIPT/REPORT OF PROCEEDING BK No.: 14-83578
December 7, 2022 at 10:32 AM

Alphonse Talarico contact@lawofficeofalphonsetalarico.com

Paul Dulberg pdulberg@icloud.com

Begin forwarded message:

From: New computer <dandereporting@gmail.com>

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR TRANSCRIPT/REPORT OF PROCEEDING BK No.: 14-83578
Date: September 26, 2022 at 4:21:29 PM CDT

To: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@icloud.com>

Paul,
I've attached both the invoice and transcript you requested.
Please click on the link at the bottom of the invoice to remit credit card payment only.

Lisa Bresnahan
Office Manager

Sent from Mail for Windows

From: Paul Dulberg

Sent: Friday, September 23, 2022 2:10 PM

To: Amy Doolin - Jerri Estelle

Subject: Re: REQUEST FOR TRANSCRIPT/REPORT OF PROCEEDING BK No.: 14-83578

Lisa,
| understand.

| am still willing to pay the expedited fee to get it as soon as | can after the audio has been
acquired.

Please keep me informed.

Thank you,
Paul

On Sep 23, 2022, at 1:05 PM, Amy Doolin - Jerri Estelle
<D.and.E.Reporting@gmail.com> wrote:

Paul,

We have to order the audio from Judge Lynch’s Clerk and then see how long it is
firct | cannot nromise we rcan set thic ta vaii in seven hiiciness davs
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Lisa Bresnahan
Office Manager.
630.917.2668 direct line

On Fri, Sep 23, 2022 at 11:06 AM Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@icloud.com> wrote:
DEAR D&E REPORTING,

| am requesting and would like to purchase a PDF of a Expedited Certified
Transcript/Report of Proceeding (7 day) for the case number and date listed
below:

Case: BK No.: 14-83578

Date: October 31, 2016

| will be paying by either credit card or debit card.

Please provide an estimate of the cost and a link for prepayment.

Thank you in advance for your help with this matter.

Sincerely,
Paul

Paul Dulberg
pdulberg@icloud.com
847-497-4250

4606 Hayden Ct.
McHenry, IL. 60051

DULBERG
10-31-16.pdf
139 KB

PAULINV.pdf
82 KB
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IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF ILLINOIS
WESTERN DIVISION

PAUL R. DULBERG, ) No. 14 B 83578

) Rockford, Illinois
) 9:30 a.m.

)

Debtor. October 31, 2016

TRANSCRIPT OF PROCEEDINGS BEFORE THE
HONORABLE THOMAS M. LYNCH

APPEARANCES:

U.S. Trustee: Mr. Joesph D. Olsen.
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THE CLERK: Paul Dulberg, 14 83578.

MR. OLSEN: Good morning, Your Honor.
Joseph Olsen, trustee.

This comes before the Court on two
motions. One is to authorize the engagement of
special counsel to pursue a personal injury
litigation, I think it's in Lake County, involving a
chainsaw accident of some sort.

And then, presumably, if the Court
grants that, the second one is to authorize the
estate to enter into -- I'm not sure what you call
it, but binding mediation. But there's a floor of
$50,000, and there's a ceiling of $300,000.

And I guess I've talked with his
attorney. He seems very enthusiastic about it.

There may be some issues about the debtor being a
good witness or not, I guess.

It had to do with a neighbor who asked
him to help him out with a chainsaw, and then I guess
the neighbor kind of cut off his arm, or almost cut
off his arm right after that. There's some
bitterness involved, understandably, I guess.

But I don't do personal injury work at
all, so I'm not sure how that all flows through to a

jury, but he didn't seem to want to go through a jury
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process. He liked this process, so...

THE COURT: Very well.

Mr. Olsen, first of all, with regard
to the application to employ the Baudin law firm, it
certainly appears to be in order and supported by
affidavit.

Their proposed fees are more
consistent with at least what generally is the market
than some of the fees you and I have seen in some
other matters.

One question for you: Have you seen
the actual engagement agreement?

MR. OLSEN: I thought it was attached
to my motion.

THE COURT: Okay.

MR. OLSEN: If it's not, it should
have been.

It's kind of an interesting —--
actually, this is kind of a unique one. The debtor
actually paid them money in advance, and then he's
going to get a credit if they actually win, which I
guess enures, now, to my benefit, but that's okay.

And there's a proviso for one-third,
except if we go to trial, then it's 40 percent. So

these are getting more creative by the PI bar as we
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plod along here, I guess, but...

THE COURT: It's a bar that's
generally pretty creative.

And my apologies. I saw the
affidavit, but you did have the agreement attached,
and one was in front of the other.

And the agreement is just as you
describe it. It appears to be reasonable, and so
I'll approve the application.

Tell me about this binding mediation.
It's almost an oxymoron, isn't it?

MR. OLSEN: Well, I guess the
mediators don't know there's a floor and a ceiling.
I'm not sure where that comes from, but that's —--
yeah.

And whatever number they come back at
is the number we're able to settle at, except if it's
a not guilty or a zero recovery, we get 50,000, but
to come back at 3 million, we're capped at 300,000.

THE COURT: Interesting.

MR. OLSEN: A copy of the mediation
agreement should also be attached to that motion.

THE COURT: And I do see that. That
appears to be in order. 1It's one of those you wish

them luck.
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MR. OLSEN: I don't want to
micromanage his case.

THE COURT: But that, too, sounds
reasonable. There's been no objection?

MR. OLSEN: Correct.

THE COURT: Very well. I will approve
-- authorize, if you will, for you to enter into the
binding mediation agreement, see where it takes you.

MR. OLSEN: Thanks, Your Honor.

(End of audio to be transcribed.)




10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

25

CERTIFICATE

I, JERRI ESTELLE, CSR, do hereby
certify that the foregoing is a true and accurate
transcription of proceedings electronically recorded
in the matter of PAUL R. DULBERG, 14 B 83578 on
October 31, 2016, which was submitted to D&E
Reporting for transcription; 1t contains all the
content in said recording; and it has been

transcribed to the best of my ability.

Jerri Estelle, CSR /S/
License Number: 084-003284




D&E Reporting, Inc.

U.S. Courthouse

219 South Dearborn Street
Room 661

Chicago, Illinois 60604
(312) 986-1920

Bill To

Paul Dulberg

INVOICE
Date Invoice #
9/26/2022 1793

Terms

Due on receipt

Description

Amount

In re: Paul Dulberg, 14-83578

Transcript of Proceedings on 10/31/22 before Judge Lynch

PAY ONLINE
HTTPS://dandereporting.com

7.00

EIN # 81-5396423

Total

$7.00
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THE CLERK: Paul Dulberg, 14 83578.

MR. OLSEN: Good morning, Your Honor.
Joseph Olsen, trustee.

This comes before the Court on two
motions. One is to authorize the engagement of
special counsel to pursue a personal injury
litigation, I think it's in Lake County, involving a
chainsaw accident of some sort.

And then, presumably, if the Court
grants that, the second one is to authorize the
estate to enter into -- I'm not sure what you call
it, but binding mediation. But there's a floor of
$50,000, and there's a ceiling of $300,000.

And I guess I've talked with his
attorney. He seems very enthusiastic about it.

There may be some issues about the debtor being a
good witness or not, I guess.

It had to do with a neighbor who asked
him to help him out with a chainsaw, and then I guess
the neighbor kind of cut off his arm, or almost cut
off his arm right after that. There's some
bitterness involved, understandably, I guess.

But I don't do personal injury work at
all, so I'm not sure how that all flows through to a

jury, but he didn't seem to want to go through a jury
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process. He liked this process, so...

THE COURT: Very well.

Mr. Olsen, first of all, with regard
to the application to employ the Baudin law firm, it
certainly appears to be in order and supported by
affidavit.

Their proposed fees are more
consistent with at least what generally is the market
than some of the fees you and I have seen in some
other matters.

One question for you: Have you seen
the actual engagement agreement?

MR. OLSEN: I thought it was attached
to my motion.

THE COURT: Okay.

MR. OLSEN: If it's not, it should
have been.

It's kind of an interesting —--
actually, this is kind of a unique one. The debtor
actually paid them money in advance, and then he's
going to get a credit if they actually win, which I
guess enures, now, to my benefit, but that's okay.

And there's a proviso for one-third,
except if we go to trial, then it's 40 percent. So

these are getting more creative by the PI bar as we
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plod along here, I guess, but...

THE COURT: It's a bar that's
generally pretty creative.

And my apologies. I saw the
affidavit, but you did have the agreement attached,
and one was in front of the other.

And the agreement is just as you
describe it. It appears to be reasonable, and so
I'll approve the application.

Tell me about this binding mediation.
It's almost an oxymoron, isn't it?

MR. OLSEN: Well, I guess the
mediators don't know there's a floor and a ceiling.
I'm not sure where that comes from, but that's —--
yeah.

And whatever number they come back at
is the number we're able to settle at, except if it's
a not guilty or a zero recovery, we get 50,000, but
to come back at 3 million, we're capped at 300,000.

THE COURT: Interesting.

MR. OLSEN: A copy of the mediation
agreement should also be attached to that motion.

THE COURT: And I do see that. That
appears to be in order. 1It's one of those you wish

them luck.
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MR. OLSEN: I don't want to
micromanage his case.

THE COURT: But that, too, sounds
reasonable. There's been no objection?

MR. OLSEN: Correct.

THE COURT: Very well. I will approve
-- authorize, if you will, for you to enter into the
binding mediation agreement, see where it takes you.

MR. OLSEN: Thanks, Your Honor.

(End of audio to be transcribed.)
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CERTIFICATE

I, JERRI ESTELLE, CSR, do hereby
certify that the foregoing is a true and accurate
transcription of proceedings electronically recorded
in the matter of PAUL R. DULBERG, 14 B 83578 on
October 31, 2016, which was submitted to D&E
Reporting for transcription; 1t contains all the
content in said recording; and it has been

transcribed to the best of my ability.

Jerri Estelle, CSR /S/
License Number: 084-003284
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