
T Kost <tkost999@gmail.com>

Re: Omni Document Examination Retainer Agreement
2 messages

Paul Dulberg <Paul_Dulberg@comcast.net> Tue, Mar 1, 2022 at 6:36 AM
To: Law Office Of Alphonse Talarico <contact@lawofficeofalphonsetalarico.com>

Dear Mr Talarico,

Today I mailed a check to you for the Omni Retainer in the amount of $1800.00.

Please let me know when you receive the check.

Thank you,
Paul

On Feb 23, 2022, at 2:15 PM, Alphonse Talarico <contact@lawofficeofalphonsetalarico.com> wrote:

Dear Mr. Dulberg,

Please see the a�ached document that I will execute on your behalf for the purpose of
contrac�ng with Omni to be the Document/Signature consul�ng/expert witness in your case
versus Popovich & Mast 17LA377.

As we discussed and you granted permission, I will pay the $1,800.00 retainer from the
$1,200.00 prepaid cost (check # 1262 from Kost) originally held to pay the cost of a
se�lement/jury verdict reporter subscrip�on for use in your case.
You expect to reimburse the $1,800.00 next week so that the fund held will again be
$1,200.00 for pursuit of the aforemen�oned se�lement/jury verdict reporters. 

If you have any ques�ons please call.

Your an�cipated coopera�on is greatly appreciated,
Alphonse A. Talarico
<Omni Document Examinations Master Attorney Retainer Agreement 010222 (3).docx>

Paul Dulberg <Paul_Dulberg@comcast.net> Sat, Feb 3, 2024 at 7:05 AM
To: Tom Kost <tkost999@gmail.com>

Begin forwarded message:
[Quoted text hidden]
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