
Date : 10/28/2023 9:49:02 AM
From : "Paul Dulberg" 
To : "Alphonse Talarico" 
Cc : "Tom Kost" , "Law Office Of Alphonse Talarico" , "Alphonse Talarico" 
BCc : "Paul Dulberg" 
Subject : Re: Payment submitted for bill 1328
Dear Mr Talarico,

Today I have mailed a check for $600.00 for Bill 1328 (Audit Trail Pro LLC) to you.

Paul

On Oct 27, 2023, at 4:53 PM, Alphonse Talarico <alphonsetalarico@yahoo.com> 
wrote:

----- Forwarded Message -----
From: Audit Trail Pro LLC (via Clio Notifications) <notifications@clio.com>
To: "alphonsetalarico@yahoo.com" <alphonsetalarico@yahoo.com>
Sent: Friday, October 27, 2023 at 04:48:31 PM CDT
Subject: Payment submitted for bill 1328
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Audit Trail Pro LLC

Payment notification 
A payment was submitted to Audit Trail Pro LLC. It will be reflected in your bank 
account within 1-2 business days. 

 

Payment information 

Name: Alphonse Talarico
Allocation:

Bill 1328
Amount: $600.00

Date: Oct 27, 2023, 04:48 PM CDT 



Confirmation #: 23NQBNJU 
Method: MasterCard ending in 8766 

 

This payment method is authorized to be stored securely for future use per the terms 
of the fee agreement. Contact Audit Trail Pro LLC for questions. 

 

This transaction will appear on your statement as a payment to AUDIT TRAIL PRO 
LLC

Keep this email for your records. For inquiries, please contact Audit Trail Pro LLC. 

This is an automated message. Please do not reply to this email.
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