Date : 9/11/2023 10:21:00 AM
From : "Alphonse Talarico"
To : "Paul Dulberg"

Cc: "Tom Kost"

Subject : Re: Fee Payment

Gentlemen,

Thank you!

| will let you know.

From: Paul Dulberg <Paul_Dulberg@comcast.net>

Sent: Monday, September 11, 2023 8:39 AM

To: Alphonse Talarico <contact@lawofficeofalphonsetalarico.com>
Cc: Tom Kost <tkost999@gmail.com>

Subject: Fee Payment

Dear Mr Talarico,
Today I have mailed a check for $15,000.00 for fees to you.
Please let me know when you receive the check.

Thank You,
Paul



