Date : 4/20/2023 11:00:02 AM
From : "Alphonse Talarico"
To : "Paul Dulberg"

Subject : Re: Fee Payment

Great, thank you so much!

From: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@icloud.com>

Sent: Thursday, April 20, 2023 9:08 AM

To: Alphonse Talarico <contact@lawofficeofalphonsetalarico.com>
Subject: Fee Payment

Dear Mr Talarico,
I have submitted the first of three payments for fees.

Amount $4000.00
Estimated arrival date: 4/26/2023

Tomorrow I will submit a second and the day after that a third.

Thank You,
Paul



