Date : 5/19/2022 10:47:56 AM

From : "Alphonse Talarico"

To : "Paul Dulberg"

Subject : Fw: Marked up Menards receipt

From: Gazelle Office <office@gazellepi.com>

Sent: Friday, May 6, 2022 7:38 PM

To: Alphonse Talarico <contact@lawofficeofalphonsetalarico.com>
Subject: Re: Marked up Menards receipt

Additionally, in regards to this receipt, the chainsaw was on sale, it is one of their low end
chainsaws and they do not have any camera footage from back that far. They did indicate that
there was a rebate on the receipt and most likely, the person that purchased it was the one who
filled out the rebate form but obviously, it's not 100%.

Respectfully,

Paul Gizel
Manager
. \ office@gazell
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On Apr 22, 2022, at 12:31 PM, Alphonse Talarico
<contact@lawofficeofalphonsetalarico.com> wrote:

Dear Paul Gizel,
Please see attached receipt with some questions.
Alphonse A. Talarico

From: Paul Dulberg <Paul Dulberg@comcast.net>

Sent: Friday, April 22, 2022 11:25 AM

To: Alphonse Talarico <contact@Ilawofficeofalphonsetalarico.com>
Subject: Marked up Menards receipt
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I’'m not sure if lllinois Sales Tax is applied to the full normal price or the sale price so | didn’t
comment on it in the attached PDF.
Open the attached PDF to see my comments about some of the things we discussed.

Special note:
Since this was paid for in Cash and can’t be tracked back to who actually purchased it, |

wonder if MENARDS has records of who they paid the rebate check to?
<MENARDS RECEIPT - Marked up with comments and a question.pdf>



