Date : 7/6/2021 9:46:39 AM

From : "Paul Dulberg"

To : "Law Office Of Alphonse Talarico"

BCc : "Paul Dulberg"

Subject : Re: 17LA377

It should have read:

Another is the cost of ordering my deposition by mistake when I asked to read Gagnon’s
deposition in December of 2013 (Haven’t found the invoice on this one yet bit it’s got to be close
to another $700.)

Obviously my Typos are killing me as wel.

Paul
|

On Jul 6, 2021, at 9:04 AM, Paul Dulberg <Paul _Dulberg@comcast.net> wrote:

Another is the cost of ordering my deposition by mistake when | asked to read Gagnon’s deposition
in December of 2012) (Haven't found the invoice on this one yet bit it's got to be close to another
$700.)
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