
Date : 3/4/2021 9:32:35 AM
From : "Paul Dulberg" 
To : "Alphonse Talarico" 
BCc : "Paul Dulberg" 
Subject : Saul ferris 
Attachment : Saul Ferris mailed letter.pdf; ATT00002.bin; saul ferris email.pdf; 
ATT00004.bin; 
2 files from Dulberg 0001-8708_Plaintiff Document Disclosure to Defense.pdf stating reasons 
Saul ferris would not take case in March of 2015
These were turned over to mast and popovich already 
Bates numbers are on the documents





From: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@comcast.net>
Subject: Fwd: Injury case


Date: December 27, 2016 4:42:48 PM CST
To: paul_dulberg@comcast.net


From: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@comcast.net>
Date: March 12, 2015 at 1:13:59 PM CDT
To: Saul Ferris <saulferris1@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: Injury case


Hi Saul,


Have you already mailed the documents or can they be picked up?


Thanks,
Paul


Paul Dulberg
847-497-4250
Sent from my iPad


On Mar 6, 2015, at 2:40 PM, Saul Ferris <saulferris1@gmail.com> wrote:


Hi Paul
I decided not to accept your case primarily based upon you settling with the homeowners for 5 thousand. I have mailed your file
back to you. I would suggest attending the pretrial to at least see what kind of settlement offer is made. Thanks for letting me
review your case. Sorry I can't help you. Best, Saul


On Mar 6, 2015 1:13 PM, "Paul Dulberg" <pdulberg@comcast.net> wrote:
Hi Saul,
I'm sending this to see if I got your email address correct.
Paul


Paul Dulberg
847-497-4250
Sent from my iPad


Dulberg 002785
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IAWO.FFICES 


FERRIS, 11IOMPSON & ZWEIG, LID. 
SAUL M. FERRIS 
GARY R. 11IOMPSON 
MICHAEL L, ZWEIG* 


RAFAEL J. GUZMAN 
ATIORNEYS AT JAW 
*Licensed in IT, &. NY 


March 4, 2015 


Mr. Paul Dulb-,rg 
3416 W. Elm Street 
McHenry, IL 60050 


RE: Your accident of January 24, 2013 


Dear Mr. Dulberg: 


103 S. GREENLF,AF AVENUE, SIBTE G 
GURNEE, ILLINOIS 60031 


TELEPHONE (847) 263-7770 
FAX (847) 263-7771 


www.ftzlaw.co111 


Thank you for consulting with our firrn on December 31, 2014 in regards to your personal injury case. Unfortunately, we have decided not to accept your case. Therefore, on behalf of Ferris, Thompson & Zweig, Ltd., we will not be taking any further action on your behalf as it relates to this matter. I believe you should not have settled with the property owners for $5,000.00. There are other reasons for my decision. 


This is merely our professional opinion and does not mean you do not have a case. We recommend that you attempt to settle tl1e case at the upcoming pretrial conference with your current attorney. 


SMF/cl 







