Date : 1/18/2021 3:04:06 PM
From : "Alphonse Talarico"

To : "Paul Dulberg"

Subject : Re: Pop disclosure doc

Dear Mr. Dulberg,

| have recapped my hand written time sheets which are the basis for my formal billing which as
| explained today, would take me away from the monumental task | am working on in getting a
necessary understanding of the many years of litigation for your matter.

| have reviewed and audited my worksheets and | am confident that the information | give you
now is accurate and that supporting detail of my activities on your case will be forthcoming
when your case demands slow down.

| currently have put in 119.35 hours since October 2020 and have spent $48.75 in necessary
expenses (initial court appearance via court call) so @225.00 per hour the total is $26, 902.50.
You deposited a retainer of $10,000.00 so the balance is $16, 902.50.

| appreciate your confidence in my ability to properly represent you after so many attorneys
have failed to do so.

Sincerely,

Alphonse A. Talarico Esq.

From: Paul Dulberg <Paul_Dulberg@comcast.net>

Sent: Monday, January 18, 2021 12:22 PM

To: Alphonse Talarico <contact@lawofficeofalphonsetalarico.com>
Subject: Pop disclosure doc

Attachment available until Feb 17, 2021
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