
From: Alphonse Talarico alphonsetalarico@yahoo.com
Subject: Re: Filing Submitted for Case: 25884372; ; Envelope Number: 25884372

Date: January 9, 2024 at 8:40 AM
To: Paul Dulberg Paul_Dulberg@comcast.net
Cc: Tom Kost tkost999@gmail.com

Gentlemen,
This is the new window I was telling you about starting Monday.
The submitted pages will not receive a file stamp marking until accepted by the clerk, anC then my account will be charged.
When the clerk of the Supreme Court of Illinois reviews the PFLTA is up to the Supreme Court.
If accepted there will be additional fees as I would have to serve 13 paper copies pursuant to rule by hand delivered to Springfield
Illinois.
Use my email to view what they have;

alphonsetalarico@yahoo.com

Thank you,

Alphonse A. Talarico Esq.
3128081410
3126081410

On Tuesday, January 9, 2024 at 08:22:08 AM CST, Paul Dulberg <paul_dulberg@comcast.net>
wrote:

Dear Mr Talarico,

Attached is a screenshot of the response when I try to download the document from eFileIL.

Can you send me a file stamped copy of the petition?

Also, Should I be cutting you a check for $51.44 for the Case fees listed on the eFileIL report?

Thank you,
Paul

On Jan 9, 2024, at 8:13 AM, Alphonse Talarico <alphonsetalarico@yahoo.com> wrote:

----- Forwarded Message -----
From: "no-reply@efilingmail.tylertech.cloud" <no-reply@efilingmail.tylertech.cloud>
To: "alphonsetalarico@yahoo.com" <alphonsetalarico@yahoo.com>
Sent: Monday, January 8, 2024 at 10:38:46 PM CST
Subject: Filing Submitted for Case: 25884372; ; Envelope Number: 25884372

Filing Submitted



Envelope Number: 25884372
Case Number: 25884372

Case Name:

The filing below has been submitted to the clerk's office for review and assigned Envelope
Number: 25884372. You will be notified by email in 24-48 hours if your filing has been accepted
or rejected.

Filing Details

Court Supreme Court of Illinois

Date/Time Submitted 1/8/2024 10:38 PM CST

Filing Type EFileAndServe

Filing Description Petition for Leave to Appeal

Filing Code Petitions - PLA Filed

Filed By Alphonse Talarico

Filing Attorney Alphonse Talarico

Fee Details

Your account is never charged until your filing is accepted. If you see any pending charges on your
account prior to acceptance, this is an authorization hold to ensure the funds are available so your filing
can be accepted without delay.

If the filing is canceled or rejected these funds will be released and will return to your account according
to your financial institution's policies (typically 3-10 business days).

This envelope is pending review and fees may change.
Case Fee Information $51.44
Case Fees $50.00
Payment Service Fees $1.44
Petitions - PLA Filed $0.00

Total:$51.44 (The envelope still has pending filings and the fees are subject to change)

Document Details

Lead Document 01082024 petition.pdf

Lead Document Page Count 18

File Copy Download Document

This link is active for 548 days.

If the link above is not accessible, copy this URL into your browser's address bar to view the
document: 
https://illinois.tylertech.cloud/ViewDocuments.aspx?FID=fcfe55a8-9896-4ae6-92e9-
10a8826de69f

If you are not represented by a lawyer, we want to improve your e-filing experience. Please click
here to fill out a short survey.

For technical assistance, contact your service provider

https://illinois.tylertech.cloud/ViewDocuments.aspx?FID=fcfe55a8-9896-4ae6-92e9-10a8826de69f
https://docs.google.com/forms/d/e/1FAIpQLScTqDkGzBQm25gaSWw8pPmfInrdkfkXBuAIS1G2Wi-MM4pqWA/viewform


For technical assistance, contact your service provider

Odyssey File & Serve

(800) 297-5377

Please do not reply to this email. It was automatically generated.




	2024-01-09_0840 AM_RECV_Fw Filing Submitted for Case 25884372  Envelope Number 25884372
	Screenshot 2024-01-09 at 8.15.20 AM

