
Date : 2/23/2023 1:32:42 PM
From : "Paul Dulberg" 
To : "Kristine Ferru" 
BCc : "Paul Dulberg" 
Subject : Re: [EXTERNAL] Expedited Request - Report of Proceedings - 17LA377 - 
3/15/2021
Attachment : 2023-02-23_Wave • Kristine Ferru, CSR, Official Court Reporter •.pdf; 
ATT00002.bin; 

Dear Kristine Ferru,

Please find the attached payment receipt.

Thank you.

Paul



On Feb 23, 2023, at 1:24 PM, Kristine Ferru <KLFerru@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov> wrote:

Hi Mr. Dulberg,
 
An estimate for the Report of Proceedings as referenced above is $220.  I can have it complete within a week.  I will send you an invoice for the deposit, which is $110.  Please let me know if you have any questions.
 
Thank you,
Kristine
From: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@icloud.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, February 22, 2023 4:02 PM
To: Kristine Ferru <KLFerru@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov>
Subject: Fwd: [EXTERNAL] Expedited Request - Report of Proceedings - 17LA377 - 3/15/2021


 
Dear Kristine Ferru,
 

I am requesting a expedited certified PDF copy of a Report of Proceedings for 3/15/2021 in case number 17LA377.

 

I don’t know if you have previously produced this as I cannot find it in our previous communications and do not seem to have a copy.

 

I am willing to pay for any fees and expedited costs incurred to produce the 3/15/2021 report of proceeding quickly. 

 

Please advise.

 

Thank You,

Paul

 

847-497-4250

pdulberg@icloud.com



Begin forwarded message:

 
From: Heather Hartwig <HVHartwig@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov>

Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] Expedited Request - Report of Proceedings - 17LA377 - 3/15/2021

Date: February 22, 2023 at 3:34:30 PM CST

To: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@icloud.com>

 
Mr. Dulberg,

 

In the last email I sent you, I put the date you first requested.  I meant to say that Kristine Ferru is the court reporter responsible for the date of 3/15/21 for the case of 17 LA 377.

 

 

Sincerely,

 

Heather Voska Hartwig

 

 

From: Heather Hartwig 
Sent: Wednesday, February 22, 2023 3:29 PM
To: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@icloud.com>
Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] Expedited Request - Report of Proceedings - 17LA377 - 3/15/2021



 

Dear Mr. Dulberg,

 

The court reporter responsible for preparing a transcript from a hearing on 3/5/21 in case 17 LA 377 is Kristine Ferru.  Kristine’s email isKLFerru@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov.   Kristine’s number is 815-334-4370.

 

Sincerely,

 

Heather Voska Hartwig

Official Court Reporter

McHenry County, Il

815-334-4347

 

 

 

From: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@icloud.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, February 22, 2023 2:05 PM
To: Heather Hartwig <HVHartwig@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Expedited Request - Report of Proceedings - 17LA377 - 3/15/2021



 

Dear Heather Hartwig,

 


After my confusion over the last request I hate to ask this but in the past few minutes it has come to my attention that I do not have a report of proceeding for March 15, 2021.


 


Yes, this time we are sure that court occurred on March 15, 2021 but are unsure if the court reporter has already produced a report of proceeding.


 


I am willing to pay for all fees associated with producing an expedited report of proceeding in PDF form.


 


Please advise.


 


Thank you, 


Paul


 


847-497-4250


pdulberg@icloud.com
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Back to Invoice


Payment Receipt
Invoice #249


for Mr. Paul Dulberg
paid on Feb. 23, 2023


Kristine Ferru, CSR, Official Court Reporter
2200 North Seminary Avenue


Room 355
WOODSTOCK, Illinois 60098


United States
Tel: 815 334 4370


Payment for Invoice #249


Payment Amount: $110.00 USD


PAYMENT METHOD:    •••• 0410


Thanks for your business. If this invoice was sent in error, please
contact fkferru@comcast.net


Wave • Kristine Ferru, CSR, Official Court Reporter • https://accounting.waveapps.com/invoices/11369780/readonly/167064...


1 of 2 2/23/23, 1:30 PM



https://accounting.waveapps.com/invoices/11369780/readonly/1670646123137637040/43623752346D435534445232336162697536473655645769734B2E58766961

https://accounting.waveapps.com/invoices/11369780/readonly/1670646123137637040/43623752346D435534445232336162697536473655645769734B2E58766961

mailto:fkferru@comcast.net

mailto:fkferru@comcast.net





Wave • Kristine Ferru, CSR, Official Court Reporter • https://accounting.waveapps.com/invoices/11369780/readonly/167064...
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https://waveapps.com/accept-invoice-payments-online?utm_campaign=Mar_03142019_powered-by-wave&utm_medium=wo-pw&utm_source=loops&utm_term=nv_nv_nv&utm_content=nv_invoice-receipt-page_icon-button_nv

https://waveapps.com/accept-invoice-payments-online?utm_campaign=Mar_03142019_powered-by-wave&utm_medium=wo-pw&utm_source=loops&utm_term=nv_nv_nv&utm_content=nv_invoice-receipt-page_icon-button_nv

https://waveapps.com/accept-invoice-payments-online?utm_campaign=Mar_03142019_powered-by-wave&utm_medium=wo-pw&utm_source=loops&utm_term=nv_nv_nv&utm_content=nv_invoice-receipt-page_icon-button_nv



