Date : 8/24/2021 9:13:41 AM

From : "Paul Dulberg"

To : "Cristin Kelly"

BCc : "Paul Dulberg"

Subject : Re: Invoice 20-112 from Cristin Kelly, CSR, RPR

Attachment : Invoice_20-112_2021-08-24.pdf; ATT00002.bin; Wave ¢ Cristin Kelly, CSR,
RPR e.pdf; ATT00004.bin;

Dear Ms Kelly,

The invoice has been paid.

Thank you,
Paul




Cristin Kelly, CSR, RPR
2200 North Seminary Avenue

Room 355
Woodstock, Illinois 60098
United States

Invoice

Invoice Number:

BILL TO

Paul Dulberg Invoice Date:

Paul Dulberg

Payment Due:

pdulberg@icloud.com

Amount Due (USD):

Quantity

17 LA 377, Dulberg vs. Hans Mast, et al.
Report of Proceedings: July 19, 2021
Judge Meyer

Expedited transcript

20-112
August 24, 2021
August 24, 2021

$0.00

Payment on August 24, 2021 using __. ending in 0410:

Amount Due (USD):







Wave e Cristin Kelly, CSR, RPR ¢

lof2

https://accounting.waveapps.com/invoices/12051533/readonly/1273285...

<chk to Invoice)

Payment Receipt
Invoice #20-112

for Paul Dulberg
paid on Aug. 24, 2021

Cristin Kelly, CSR, RPR
2200 North Seminary Avenue
Room 355

Woodstock, lllinois 60098
United States

Payment for Invoice #20-112

Payment Amount: $81.25 USD

PAYMENT METHOD: ++++ 0410

Thanks for your business. If this invoice was sent in error,
please contact cristinkelly@aol.com

C )

8/24/21,9:09 AM
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Wave e Cristin Kelly, CSR, RPR ¢ https://accounting.waveapps.com/invoices/12051533/readonly/1273285...

2 of 2 8/24/21,9:09 AM







On Aug 24, 2021, at 8:24 AM, Cristin Kelly, CSR, RPR <mailer@waveapps.com> wrote:

						Cristin Kelly, CSR, RPR




		

		Invoice for $81.25 due by Aug 24, 2021











								Review & Pay 
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						Mr. Dulberg, 

This is the invoice for the transcript you have requested from July 19, 2021 in Case No. 17 LA 377.

I anticipate the transcript being completed no later than Wednesday afternoon. Upon payment, I will send a PDF copy of the transcript to this email address.

Please reach out to me with any questions you may have.

Thank you, 
Cristin Kelly

















				Invoice 20-112



		View Invoice


		Cristin Kelly, CSR, RPR
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