
Date : 12/28/2022 1:15:28 PM
From : "Kathleen Strombach" 
To : "Paul Dulberg" 
Subject : RE: [EXTERNAL] 17LA377 Request for report of proceeding 12/21/2022
 
Good afternoon,
 
The requested transcript is complete.  The total is $85.00.  I can take payment via Zelle at 
kstrombach@hotmail.com or credit card over the phone at 815.334.4372.
 
Thank you,
Kathleen Strombach
Official Court Reporter
 

From: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@icloud.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, December 21, 2022 12:39 PM
To: Kathleen Strombach <KMStrombach@22ndCircuit.IllinoisCourts.gov>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] 17LA377 Request for report of proceeding 12/21/2022
 
Dear Kathleen Strombach,
 
I am requesting and would like to purchase a certified copy of the report of proceedings that took place 
on December 21, 2022 (12/21/2022) for case number 17LA377 in PDF form.
 
The zoom hearing was in front of Associate Judge Meyer in Room 201 at 10:00 AM. 
 
Please advise.
 
Thank you in advance for your help with this matter.
 
Sincerely,
Paul
 
PAUL DULBERG 
847-497-4250
pdulberg@icloud.com
4606 Hayden Ct.
McHenry, IL. 60051

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the County network. Do not click 
links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is 

safe. 

While mismatches between the actual SENDER field and the FROM field are 
common. It is also a common spoofing tactic. For additional reference, this email was 

actually sent from pdulberg@icloud.com

If you have any questions about the legitimacy of this email, please call the helpdesk 
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at extension 4828.
 


