
Date : 4/27/2022 1:05:03 PM
From : "Judy Carlson" 
To : "Paul Dulberg" 
Cc : "Stacey Collins" 
Subject : RE: [EXTERNAL] Request for Report of Proceeding for April 27, 2022 case 
number 17LA377 
Attachment : image001.png; 
 
Good Afternoon Mr. Dulberg,
 
The court reporter responsible for preparing the transcript is Stacey Collins.  She can be reached at (815) 
334-4378 or SACollins@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov.  I have also cc’d her on this email.
 
If you need further assistance, please feel free to contact me.
 
Thank you,
 
 
Judy Carlson, CSR
Official Court Reporter
CRS Supervisor
2200 N. Seminary Ave. Suite 355
Woodstock, IL 60098
(815) 334-4373
 

 
STATE OF ILLINOIS
CIRCUIT COURT
22ND JUDICIAL CIRCUIT
McHENRY COUNTY, ILLINOIS
 
 
CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE:  This electronic message and all of its contents contain information from the 22nd 
Judicial Circuit which may be privileged, confidential or otherwise protected from disclosure.  The information is 
intended to be for the addressee(s) only.  If you are not an addressee, any disclosure, copying, distribution or use of 
the contents of this message, or any portion thereof, is strictly prohibited.  If you have received this electronic 
message in error, please notify us immediately at (815) 334-4385 and destroy the original message and all copies. 
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From: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@icloud.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, April 27, 2022 12:39 PM
To: Judy Carlson <JACarlson@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Request for Report of Proceeding for April 27, 2022 case number 17LA377 
 
Dear Judy Carlson,
 
I am resending this request from a different email since there were issues in the past getting replies 
from the previously used email address.
 
I am requesting a PDF of a certified and signed, with the CRS’s CSR license number on the certification 
page, Report of Proceeding for April 27, 2022 case number 17LA377.
 
This hearing is approximately an hour and a half long so please have the assigned CRS employee provide 
an estimate with a link for payment intended to be paid with a debit card.
 
The court order for this hearing is Due by Friday April 29, 2022 and due to the complexity of the rulings 
should be based on this Report of Proceeding and not one’s personal notes so I am willing to pay for any 
expenses required for an expedited Report of Proceeding.
 
Please feel free to reach out to me with any questions.
 
Thank you in advance for your help with this matter.
 
Sincerely,
Paul
 
Paul Dulberg
847-497-4250
pdulberg@icloud.com
4606 Hayden Ct.
McHenry, IL. 60051

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the County network. Do not click 
links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is 

safe. 

While mismatches between the actual SENDER field and the FROM field are 
common. It is also a common spoofing tactic. For additional reference, this email was 

actually sent from pdulberg@icloud.com

If you have any questions about the legitimacy of this email, please call the helpdesk 
at extension 4828.
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