Date : 3/24/2022 9:23:33 AM

From : "Paul Dulberg"

To : "Kristine Ferru"

BCec : "Paul Dulberg" , "Alphonse Talarico"

Subject : Re: Request for both new and previously prepared transcripts for case number
17LA377

Attachment : 2022-03-24_17L.A377_Wave ¢ Kristine Ferru, CSR, Official Court Reporter
o.pdf; ATT00002.txt;

Dear Kiristine Ferru,
Please find the attached PDF of the payment receipt.

Thank you,
Paul

Paul Dulberg
847-497-4250

4606 Hayden Ct.
McHenry, IL. 60051
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Payment Receipt
Invoice #129

for Mr. Paul Dulberg
paid on March 24, 2022

Kristine Ferru, CSR, Official Court Reporter
2200 North Seminary Avenue
Room 355
WOODSTOCK, lllinois 60098
United States
Tel: 815 334 4370

Payment for Invoice #129

Payment Amount: $68.75 USD

PAYMENT METHOD: ++++ 0410

https://accounting.waveapps.com/invoices/11369780/readonly/1426965...

<chk to Invoice>

3/24/22,9:18 AM



https://accounting.waveapps.com/invoices/11369780/readonly/1426965090631981795/5464653844494E6D304965676A504445636B50684837422E62494D48445575

https://accounting.waveapps.com/invoices/11369780/readonly/1426965090631981795/5464653844494E6D304965676A504445636B50684837422E62494D48445575



Wave ¢ Kristine Ferru, CSR, Official Court Reporter ® https://accounting.waveapps.com/invoices/11369780/readonly/1426965...

Thanks for your business. If this invoice was sent in error,
please contact fkferru@comcast.net

C )
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> On Mar 23, 2022, at 10:36 AM, Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@icloud.com> wrote:
> 
> Dear Kristine Ferru,
> 
> I am requesting both new and previously prepared transcripts for case number 17LA377, certified and signed in PDF format.
> 
> The list below was provided by Judy Carlson and should reflect which transcripts you already prepared and which one need to be done.
> 
> Kristine Ferru KLFerru@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov (815) 334-4370
> 1-4-22 – Transcript already prepared
> 3-25-2021
> 10-15-2018
> 
> As usual I am willing to pay an expedited fee to get these as soon as I can.
> 
> I will be paying by either a debit card or an ACH bank transfer.
> 
> Please call or send a link for payment once you know the total and I will promptly take care of it.
> 
> Thank you in advance for your help with this matter,
> Paul
> 
> Paul Dulberg 
> 847-497-4250
> 4606 Hayden Ct.
> Mchenry, IL. 60051



