Date : 1/11/2022 1:14:46 PM
From : "Paul Dulberg"

To : "Heather Hartwig"
BCc : "Paul Dulberg"
Subject : Re:

Dear Heather Hartwig,

I have a family member who has a PayPal account so If you send the PayPal invoice it can be
paid that way but will happen later tonight when they are at home.

Thank You,
Paul

847-497-4250
Paul Dulberg

4606 Hayden Ct.
McHenry, IL. 60051

On Jan 10, 2022, at 4:45 PM, Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@icloud.com> wrote:

Dear Heather Hartwig,

Yes, I will be order the transcripts.

I do not have a PayPal account.

I do have a debit card or we can use a ACH Bank transfer.
Let me know how best to pay you.

Thank You,
Paul

On Jan 10, 2022, at 4:33 PM, Heather Hartwig
<HVHartwig@?22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov> wrote:

Dear Mr. Dulberg,

| am estimating the cost for the four transcripts you inquired about in case 12
LA 178 — 2/4/15, 4/16/14, 8/14/13, 1/30/13 — to be $110.
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If you would like to order those transcripts, please email me back and | will
send you a PayPal invoice to pay for the estimate with a credit or debit card.
If you’d rather, you are also able to send me a check or pay with cash.

Sincerely,

Heather Hartwig



