
Date : 2/17/2021 3:53:43 PM
From : "Paul Dulberg" 
To : "Stacey Collins" 
BCc : "Paul Dulberg" 
Subject : Re: [EXTERNAL] 17 LA 377
Attachment : Invoice_2020-011_2021-02-17.pdf; ATT00002.bin; 
Dear Stacy Collins,

I have attached a file named Invoice_2020-011_2021-02-17.pdf

It is the receipt I received when I paid the invoice.

Yes, Please forward the report of proceedings to this email address.

Thank You,
Paul





INVOICE
Stacey A. Collins


Official Court Reporter
2200 N. Seminary Avenue - Room 355


Woodstock, Illinois 60098
United States


815 334 4378


BILL TO
Paul Dulberg


pdulberg@comcast.net


Invoice Number: 2020-011


Invoice Date: February 17, 2021


Payment Due: February 17, 2021


Amount Due (USD): $0.00


Services Amount


Report of Proceedings
Dulberg v Mast - 17 LA 377


$150.00


Total: $150.00


Payment on February 17, 2021 using a bank payment: $150.00


Amount Due (USD): $0.00






On Feb 17, 2021, at 2:34 PM, Stacey Collins <SACollins@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov> wrote:

Mr. Dulberg,
 
I have completed the report of proceedings in the above referenced case.  I will be sending an invoice in a separate email to you.  Upon receipt of payment, I will forward a PDF Report of proceedings to you via this email address.
 
 
Stacey A. Collins
Official Court Reporter
22nd Judicial Circuit
Woodstock, IL
 
 
<image001.jpg>
 
LEGAL CONFIDENTIAL: The information in this e-mail and in any attachment contains information which is legally privileged. It is intended only for the attention and use of the named recipient. If you are not the intended recipient, you are not authorized to retain, disclose, copy or distribute the message and/or any of its attachments. If you received this e-mail in error, please notify Stacey A. Collins, CSR, and delete this message.
 
 
 
From: Paul Dulberg [mailto:pdulberg@comcast.net] 
Sent: Wednesday, February 10, 2021 2:14 PM
To: Stacey Collins <SACollins@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: 17 LA 377


 
This works.
 
I will be using the bank-to-bank payment.

 

Look forward to hearing from you between 2/16-2/19
 

Thank you in advance for your help with this matter and hope you enjoy your days off,

Paul




On Feb 10, 2021, at 2:10 PM, Stacey Collins <SACollins@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov> wrote:

 
What I am willing to do is this:

I will have the transcript done for you sometime next week, 2/16-2/19.

I will waive the deposit process, but payment is due at the time the transcript is completed.  I will invoice you with the exact amount.  My invoicing allows for payment via ACH (a direct bank-to-bank payment).  I do not accept credit cards for payment.  You can also send a paper check if you prefer.  Once I receive your payment, I will send the report of proceedings to you via email.  

 

 

Stacey A. Collins

Official Court Reporter

22nd Judicial Circuit

Woodstock, IL

 

 

<image001.jpg>
 

LEGAL CONFIDENTIAL: The information in this e-mail and in any attachment contains information which is legally privileged. It is intended only for the attention and use of the named recipient. If you are not the intended recipient, you are not authorized to retain, disclose, copy or distribute the message and/or any of its attachments. If you received this e-mail in error, please notify Stacey A. Collins, CSR, and delete this message.
 

 

 

From: Paul Dulberg [mailto:pdulberg@comcast.net] 
Sent: Wednesday, February 10, 2021 2:02 PM
To: Stacey Collins <SACollins@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov>
Subject: Re: [EXTERNAL] 17 LA 377



 

I was given 28 days so as soon as I can. 

 


If your on a short week and have a few days off next week that’s okay. I understand the need for time off. 


 


When do you think you can have it by and can I pay the deposit now so that when you do get to it you have everything you need?


 


Thanks,


Paul


 


 






On Feb 10, 2021, at 1:56 PM, Stacey Collins <SACollins@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov> wrote:


 

Well, let’s start with the delivery timeframe.  How soon would you need delivery of the report of proceedings?


 


From: Paul Dulberg [mailto:pdulberg@comcast.net] 
Sent: Wednesday, February 10, 2021 12:47 PM
To: Stacey Collins <SACollins@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: 17 LA 377




 


Dear Stacy Collins,


 



Yes, I am requesting/inquiring about a report of proceedings from February 10, 2021, in the above-referenced case.











How do I go about paying the $85 deposit needed?



 



Thank You,



Paul



 



Paul Dulberg



847-497-4250



pdulberg@comcast.net









On Feb 10, 2021, at 12:41 PM, Stacey Collins <SACollins@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov> wrote:



 


<ESTIMATED COST OF TRANSCRIBED REPORT OF PROCEEDINGS.docx>






 



		CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the County network. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

While mismatches between the actual SENDER field and the FROM field are common. It is also a common spoofing tactic. For additional reference, this email was actually sent frompdulberg@comcast.net

If you have any questions about the legitimacy of this email, please call the helpdesk at extension 4828.
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