Date : 2/10/2021 2:01:33 PM

From : "Paul Dulberg"

To : "Stacey Collins"

BCc : "Paul Dulberg"

Subject : Re: [EXTERNAL] 17 LA 377
I was given 28 days so as soon as I can.

If your on a short week and have a few days off next week that’s okay. I understand the need for
time off.

When do you think you can have it by and can I pay the deposit now so that when you do get to
it you have everything you need?

Thanks,
Paul

On Feb 10, 2021, at 1:56 PM, Stacey Collins
<SACollins@?22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov> wrote:

Well, let’s start with the delivery timeframe. How soon would you need delivery of the
report of proceedings?

From: Paul Dulberg [mailto:pdulberg@comcast.net]

Sent: Wednesday, February 10, 2021 12:47 PM

To: Stacey Collins <SACollins@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: 17 LA 377

Dear Stacy Collins,

Yes, I am requesting/inquiring about a report of proceedings from February 10, 2021, in
the above-referenced case.

How do | go about paying the $85 deposit needed?

Thank You,
Paul

Paul Dulberg
847-497-4250
pdulberg@comcast.net
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On Feb 10, 2021, at 12:41 PM, Stacey Collins
<SACollins@?22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov> wrote:

<ESTIMATED COST OF TRANSCRIBED REPORT OF
PROCEEDINGS.docx>

1ated from outside of the County network. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender a

e actual SENDER field and the FROM field are common. It is also a common spoofing tactic. For additional referenc
frompdulberg@comcast.net

If you have any questions about the legitimacy of this email, please call the helpdesk at extension 4828.
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